


Geo-Pal Uganda 
1 Aims and Scope 
Geo-Pal Uganda is a scientific journal whose aim is
to provide a vehicle for the dissemination of 
knowledge concerning the geology and 
palaeontology of Uganda. It publishes original 
papers that contribute to scientific debate on issues 
in geology and palaeontology relevant to Uganda 
and neighbouring countries where there may be an 
overlap in interests. Its scope embraces all fields of 
investigation in palaeontology and in the case of 

geology, all fields that may throw light on the 
context of its fossil record (geological context, 
radio-isotopic age determinations, stratigraphy, 
palaeoclimatology, palaeoenvironments, etc.). 
Original articles, as well as review articles are 
accepted. Each publication will appear as a separate 
issue of the journal and will be published as soon as 
possible after the editors are satisfied that the 
scientific quality of the article warrants its 
disssemination. 

2 Submission of manuscripts 
Authors should submit their articles to Geo-Pal 
Uganda in electronic format in order to facilitate the 
editorial and reviewing process and thereby to 
shorten publication time. Manuscripts should be  

sent to the Uganda Museum, Kira Road, P.O. Box 
5718, Kampala, Uganda by mail or preferably by 
email to the editor. 
Contact 
ezramusime@yahoo.com

3 Copyright Information 
Submission of a manuscript implies that the work 
has not been published before (except in the form of 
an abstract, a review or thesis), that it is not under 
consideration for publication elsewhere; that its 
publication has been approved by all co-authors and
by the authorities at the establishment where the 
research was carried out. Transfer of copyright to 
the Uganda Museum becomes effective if and when 
the article is accepted for publication. 
The copyright covers the exclusive right to 
reproduce and distribute the article, including 
reprints, translations, photographic reproductions,  

microform, electronic form (offline, online) or other 
reproductions of similar nature. All articles  
published in this journal are protected by copyright, 
which covers the exclusive rights to reproduce and 
distribute the article (e.g. as offprints, pdfs), as well 
as all translation rights. No material published in
this journal may be reproduced photographically or 
stored on microfilm, in electronic data bases, video 
disks etc., without first obtaining written permission 
from the copyright owners. 
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Copies of published articles can be obtained from 
the Uganda Museum, P.O. Box 5718, Kampala, 
Uganda, by requesting the article either printed on
paper, or in pdf format. Articles printed on paper 
will imply a charge of $20 to cover handling and 

postal fees. Articles in pdf format will be sent free 
of charge. Requests for articles should preferably be 
made by email to the Chief Commissioner of the 
Uganda Museum mwanjankale@yahoo.com copied 
to <saramussasarah@yahoo.com> and  
<ezramusime@yahoo.com>. 
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